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	 SOUNDSHAPES OF SOUNDSCAPES
	 - To formulate visible notations of invisible sound experiences.

There is an invisible architecture, a sonical-
ly experienced space – a soundscape. The 
aim of this thesis is to explore how that expe-
rience can be formulated and communicated 
visually. This will be investigated through the 
idea of translation defined as a “rendering of 
the same ideas in a different language from 
the original”. Invisible impermanent sound 
experience in ear are, through sensitive for-
mulating hands, translated to a visible per-
manence, which enables a communicative 
process.

Today, there is a developed symbolic lang-
uage for visual architecture, but symbols for 
aural architecture seem to be sparse. This 
thesis is trans-disciplinary, building on know-
ledge from the disciplines of architecture, 
music and semiotics. By developing a sys-
tem of symbols to represent sound experien-
ces - a prescriptive notational system like the 
musical notations, this thesis aims to contri-
bute to the discussion of how architects can 
communicate desirable soundscapes in the 
design process.

How can invisible sound experiences be for-
mulated and communicated visually?

To answer the question this thesis is divided 

into four main sections. The first section 
presents, nine well-selected sound expe-
riences recorded on Iceland – a land with 
a fascinating soundscape. In the second 
section the recorded sounds are explored 
and understood through five different expe-
riments – various medias are formed during 
intensive listening. In the third, the outcome 
from the five experiments is summarized 
into a prescriptive notational system that 
tries to tell the eye what the ear will hear 
- a translation of the sound experiences, 
caught in one visual soundshape – a sound 
cube.  In the fourth and last section, the 
sound cubes are read as instructions to cre-
ate aural spaces – a first sketch of design. 

This thesis should be seen as a curious ex-
ploration to look beyond the obvious, rather 
than an attempt to explain sound as a phe-
nomenon. Rather than seeking for one an-
swer, the aim is to find new ways to visually 
express sound experiences, make sound 
a natural part of the design process and in 
turn make the ear a more integral part of 
experiencing architecture.
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